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Urodynamic stress incontinence (USI) is a 
prevalent condition among women, 
characterized by involuntary urine leakage 
during activities that increase intra-abdominal 
pressure, such as coughing, sneezing, or physical 
exertion.[1] Stress urethral pressure profile 
(sUPP) measurement is an important diagnostic 
tool used during urodynamic studies to assess 
urethral function. In some women with USI, 
involuntary urine leakage occurs during this 
measurement, yet the clinical and urodynamic 
significance of this leakage remains unclear.[2] 
This study aims to elucidate the differences in 
clinical and urodynamic findings between 
women with USI who experience involuntary 
urine leakage during sUPP measurement and 
those who do not.

Between July 2009 and December 2023, a total 
of 481 women with USI were included and 
divided into positive and negative sUPP groups. 
The medical records, including urodynamic 
study (UDS), 3-day bladder dairy [3-5] and 
questionnaires regarding lower urinary tract 
symptoms (LUTS) were reviewed. Wilcoxon rank 
sum test or chi-square test were used for 
statistical analysis, as appropriate. Linear 
regression analysis was performed to adjust for 
the presence of overactive bladder (OAB) 
syndrome. A p < 0.05 was considered 
statistically significant. 

Women with USI who exhibit involuntary urine 
leakage during stress urethral pressure 
measurement have more severe LUTS, poorer 
urethral function, and smaller bladder capacity 
compared to those without leakage. 
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Subjectively, the percentage of stress urinary 
incontinence was similar in the two groups, but 
overactive bladder syndrome (OAB) was more 
prevalent in positive sUPP group, which also 
revealed more bladder oversensitivity and 
smaller bladder capacity in UDS objectively. 
There was no difference in all the subjective 
questionnaires between the two groups. 
However, the positive sUPP group revealed 
higher episodes of urgency, daytime frequency, 
incontinence, and nocturia derived from its 3-
day bladder diary record, compared to the 
negative sUPP group. Furthermore, the positive 
sUPP group revealed a larger pad weight and a 
lower maximum urethral closure pressure 
(MUCP) in UPP data. Adjusted by OAB, the 
positive sUPP group still has higher episodes of 
urgency, daytime frequency, incontinence, and 
nocturia, smaller bladder capacity, a lower 
MUCP, and a longer functional pressure profile 
length, compared to the negative sUPP group.

Table Comparisons between positive and 
negative stress urethral pressure measurement 
in women with urodynamic stress incontinence.
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